NSW ICAC EXHIBIT

From: Byrnes, Barry

Sent: Tuesday, 1 April 2014 3:02 PM

To: Goodman, Gary :

Subject: FW: City of Botany Bay Council ... Mitsubishi Rosa Bus ... CBB508
Gary,

i appears that this amount has not been paid.
Do you know what is happening?

Barry

From: Bulock, Bryan

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2014 2:43 PM

Ta: Joe Freitas

Cc: Byrnes, Barry; Goodman, Gary

Subject: City of Botany Bay Council ... Mitsubishi Rosa Bus ... CBB508

Joe Freitas
Efias and Son Smash Repairs

Hithere Joe and just a friendly reminder concerning the reimbursement to Council
on this 1

$8,850.00 is due

Kindly forward that amount to the Council as soon as possible
marked to the attention of Barry Byrnes please

With regards and thanks
Bryan Bulock
City of Botany Bay Council





